
$3500.00 / Monthly - 1007 - 220 MISSINNIHE WAY W
 

Listing ID: W9010277

$3500.00 / Monthly
2 Bedrooms, 2 BathroomsSingle Family

1007 - 220 MISSINNIHE WAY W,
Mississauga, Ontario, L5H0A9

Welcome to Brightwater II Condos and
experience this stunning 2 bedroom, 2
bathroom unit boasting floor-to-ceiling
windows and an open concept layout that
seamlessly integrates the kitchen, living and
dining areas, offering a bright and
welcoming retreat. The space boasts
generous closet spaces in the
accommodating bedrooms, and offers
breathtaking lake views. Enjoy amazing
amenities within in the building such as a
gym, co-working space, party/lounge area,
concierge service and a shuttle bus to the
GO station. Thoughtfully designed for
functionality and modern living, the unit
also comes with a locker for ample storage
and 1 parking space. Do not miss out on this
opportunity! **** EXTRAS **** Close
proximity to trendy restaurants, Port Credit's
unique shops and cafes, waterfront parks
and trails, prestigious schools, and easy
access to Downtown Toronto via the QEW,
Port Credit GO or Clarkson GO Station.
(id:54154)
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