
$649,990 - 209 - 145 HILLCREST AVENUE
 

Listing ID: W8302934

$649,990
2 Bedrooms, 1 BathroomsSingle Family

209 - 145 HILLCREST AVENUE,
Mississauga, Ontario, L5B3Z1

Welcome to 145 Hillcrest, this sought after
building is located in the heart of
Mississauga and only steps away from
shopping, schools and parks, easy highway
access and minutes from the Cooksville Go
station, and the upcoming Hurontario LRT.
This 2 bedroom unit offers over 900 square
feet of beautifully updated living space.
Featuring new flooring throughout and
stylishly updated eat-in kitchen with quartz
counters, ceramic backsplash and stainless
steel appliances. Formal dining room area
opens up to large living room space. The
updated bathroom offers neutral decor, and
ceramic flooring. The primary bedroom has
a large walk in closet. The great solarium
space is currently being used as home office
space, an In suite laundry with stackable
washer and dryer complete the unit. Condo
amenities including a library, party/meeting
room, squash court, sauna, tennis court,
gym, and more. (id:54154)
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