
$3195.00 / Monthly - #307 -220 MISSINNIHE WAY
 

Listing ID: W8107282

$3195.00 / Monthly
3 Bedrooms, 2 BathroomsSingle Family

#307 -220 MISSINNIHE WAY,
Mississauga, Ontario, L5H0A9

Welcome to Brightwater II, a new
condominium residence offering
unparalleled waterfront living in Port Credit.
Come enjoy this never lived in, newly built
2+1 bed, 2 bath unit with floor to ceiling
windows with Lake Views and natural light
pouring in. Modern kitchen with a large
island offers the perfect space to entertain
guests. The list of luxurious amenities at
Brightwater II goes on and on including a
sauna, fitness center, rooftop lounge, open-
air swim spa, and sundeck. Port Credit GO
is just a short walk away. Come experience
luxury living at Brightwater II. Shuttle Bus
available from Building to go Station. ****
EXTRAS **** Explore Port Credit village
with charming shops & restaurants, scenic
Waterfront Trail, vibrant Port Credit
Harbour Marina. Experience waterfront
living at its finest (id:54154)
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